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The Fed’s next chapter: 

this is no regular interest-

rate cut 

The majority of media coverage and market 

commentary we’ve seen so far has focused on what 

the Fed did on Wednesday, that is, the quantum of 

the rate cut and the ensuing market reaction. The 

“what” was relatively straightforward: 

 Interest rates were cut by 25bps. 

 The Fed’s balance sheet runoff known as 

quantitative tightening (QT) now ends as of 

1 August, two months earlier than initially 

planned. This makes sense: Why ease with 

one tool but tighten with another? 

 The interest rate it pays banks to park their 

excess reserves at the central bank was cut 

by 25bps, from 2.35% to 2.10%. 

However, we believe the why—the rationale behind 

the Fed’s decision—is far more important. 

Unfortunately, it’s also more difficult to discern. 

Formally, the Fed’s statement implies the decision 

to cut rates was fairly broad, attributing it to “the 

implications of global developments for the 

economic outlook as well as muted inflation 

pressures.” However, during Wednesday’s press 

conference, Fed Chair Jerome Powell also 

continued to emphasise that the Fed’s base case 

for the economy is “a positive one” that includes a 

sustained economic expansion1. In which case, why 

cut? We believe the Fed is substantially more 

focused on inflation and inflation expectations than 

its statement formally alludes to, and its desire to 

boost price pressures is the primary driver behind 

Wednesday’s rate cut—and for that matter, any 

forthcoming rate cuts. 

Investors are likely to have come across two 

different broad sets of narratives explaining the 

Fed’s decision to embark on a rate-cutting path. 

The first, favoured by a group of market watchers 

who belong to what we call the “easing cycle” 

camp, suggests this could mark the beginning of a 

more typical Fed-easing cycle, similar to the 

majority of those seen in the past three decades. 

On average, easing cycles tend to produce around 

500bps of rate cuts and are typically a reaction to 

an economy that’s already in, or is heading toward 

a recession. In the current environment, a traditional 

easing cycle would imply that the Federal Open 

Market Committee (FOMC) will take rates to 0% or 

below and that the US 10-year Treasury yield will 

also fall to zero, which will likely be accompanied by 

some pain for risk assets. Admittedly, after 

Wednesday’s surprisingly robust press conference, 

this narrative is likely to be relegated to the 

sidelines … at least for now. 

 

 

1
“Federal Reserve issues FOMC Statement,” federalreserve.gov, 31 

July 2019.  

The US Federal Reserve (Fed) trimmed rates by 25 basis points (bps), as has 

been widely expected. Frances Donald, Chief Economist and Head of 

Macroeconomic Strategy,  believes that the Fed’s going to cut at least once more, 

probably in September, and the 2016/2018 hiking cycle is now over. Donald also 

explains why Wednesday’s interest-rate decision is far more significant than it 

may initially seem.  
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The second narrative, advocated by those in the 

“insurance cuts” camp, suggests that these cuts—

which typically involve lowering rates by a total of 

75bps in one or two increments—are intended to 

offset short-term cyclical weakness in US growth, in 

this case, because of trade tensions and weak 

global manufacturing activity. The Fed has acted 

similarly (twice) in the 1990s: It most famously 

undertook this approach in 1995 and again in 1998.  

Fed Chair Powell’s insistence during Wednesday’s 

press conference that the Fed is engineering a 

“mid-cycle adjustment”2 is far more consistent with 

the insurance cuts camp versus the easing cycle 

camp, and markets appear to be unwinding a good 

deal of their easing cycle pricing.   

We believe the narrative needs further refining. In 

our view, the Fed could be engaging in an 

important variation of the insurance cut that it 

hasn’t done before, which we call the “reflation 

cut.” These cuts aren’t primarily designed to 

support short-term growth (although that’s a helpful 

offshoot, particularly in an environment defined by 

elevated uncertainty), or as a response to recession 

risk. Instead, they’re undertaken to produce a 

structural inflationary overshoot and to reignite 

persistently weak inflation expectations that have 

become de-anchored from 2%. If this is indeed the 

case, by explicitly attempting to engineer greater 

than 2% inflation, the FOMC will likely contribute to 

an overheating of the US economy. 

The most important difference between a typical 

insurance cut and our theory of reflation cuts is that 

central bank dovishness doesn’t end when growth 

reaccelerates; it only ends when inflation has 

persistently overshot 2%. This implies that (a) the 

Fed’s likely to stay on hold once it’s done cutting for 

a prolonged period of time, longer than it would 

have done in an insurance cut environment, and (b) 

risk assets could benefit from both lower rates and 

stronger growth.  

Our key takeaway from Wednesday’s press 

conference is that it confirmed our belief that the 

 

2
 FOMC Press Conference, federalreserve.gov, 31 July 2019. 

Fed’s trying to ease its way into an economic 

stabilisation (and potentially into a reacceleration). 

In other words, we believe Wednesday’s interest-

rate cut is indeed a “mid-cycle adjustment”2 

designed to stoke inflation. This is consistent with 

our near-term market views that:  

 Risk assets can continue to do moderately well, 

as these cuts will support the extension of the 

economic cycle.  

 No substantial repricing at the front-end of the 

yield curve because in our view, interest-rate 

cuts of between 50bps and 75bps followed by a 

long pause is consistent with the reflation cut 

mandate of two to three interest-rate cuts. 

Ultimately, regardless of which camp we end up 

belonging to, the broader story is clear: The Fed’s 

going to cut at least once more, probably in 

September, and the 2016/2018 hiking cycle is now 

over.  
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Interest-rate cuts: three different narratives 

Narrative Type 

Notable periods 

when it has 

been deployed 

The average 

magnitude of 

rate cut 

Characteristics 

Easing cycle cuts 

1989–1993; 

2000–2003; 

2007–2009 

500 bps 

 Employed towards or during the end of an 

economic cycle to combat an impending 

recession 

 Historically associated with recession and 

therefore negative for risk assets  

 Rate cuts end as the economy enters a new 

growth cycle 

Insurance cuts 1995–1996; 1999 75bps 

 Employed to fend off expected near-term 

economic weakness  

 Rate cuts end once the economy stabilises 

and/or downside risks fail to materialise 

 Historically positive for risk assets 

Reflation cuts (a 

variation of 

insurance cuts)  

 

 

Untested 

 

50-75bps  

 Employed to ignite inflation and inflation 

expectations, with the implicit intention of 

allowing inflation to overshoot the official 

target, and the US economy to overheat in the 

short term 

 Rate cuts only end when inflation undershoot 

is corrected, implying risk assets can 

substantially benefit from lower rates and 

better economic growth 

Source: Manulife Investment Management, 30 July 2019. 
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Disclaimer 
 
Manulife Asset Management is the asset management division of 

Manulife Financial. The information and/or analysis contained in this 
material have been compiled or arrived at from sources believed to be 
reliable but Manulife Asset Management does not make any 

representation as to their accuracy, correctness, usefulness or 
completeness and does not accept liability for any loss arising from the 
use hereof or the information and/or analysis contained herein. Neither 

Manulife Asset Management or its affiliates, nor any of their directors, 
officers or employees shall assume any liability or responsibility for any 
direct or indirect loss or damage or any other consequence of any 

person acting or not acting in reliance on the information contained 
herein. 
 

This material was prepared solely for educational and informational 
purposes and does not constitute a recommendation, professional 
advice, an offer, solicitation or an invitation by or on behalf of Manulife 

Asset Management to any person to buy or sell any security. Nothing in 
this material constitutes investment, legal, accounting or tax advice, or a 
representation that any investment or strategy is suitable or appropriate 

to your individual circumstances, or otherwise constitutes a personal 
recommendation to you. The economic trend analysis expressed in this 
material does not indicate any future investment performance result.   

This material was produced by and the opinions expressed are those of 
Manulife Asset Management as of the date of this publication, and are 
subject to change based on market and other conditions. Past 

performance is not an indication of future results. Investment involves 
risk, including the loss of principal. In considering any investment, if you 
are in doubt on the action to be taken, you should consult professional 

advisers. 
 
Proprietary Information – Please note that this material must not be 

wholly or partially reproduced, distributed, circulated, disseminated, 
published or disclosed, in any form and for any purpose, to any third 
party without prior approval from Manulife Asset Management. 

 
These materials have not been reviewed by, are not registered with any 
securities or other regulatory authority, and may, where appropriate, be 

distributed by the following Manulife entities in their respective 
jurisdictions.  
 

Indonesia: PT Manulife AsetManajmenIndonesia. Malaysia: Manulife 
Asset Management Services Berhad. Thailand: Manulife Asset 
Management (Thailand) Company Limited. Singapore: Manulife Asset 

Management (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (Company Registration Number: 
200709952G). Vietnam: Manulife Asset Management (Vietnam) 
Company Ltd. Australia, South Korea and Hong Kong: Manulife Asset 

Management (Hong Kong) Limited in Hong Kong and has not been 
reviewed by the HK Securities and Futures Commission (SFC). 
Philippines: Manulife Asset Management and Trust Corporation Japan: 

Manulife Asset Management (Japan) Limited. Taiwan: Manulife Asset 
Management (Taiwan) Pte. Ltd. (Investment is not protected by deposit 
insurance, insurance guaranty fund or other protection mechanism in 

Taiwan. For the disputes resulted from the investment, you may file a 
complaint to the Securities Investment Trust & Consulting Association of 
the R.O.C. or Financial Ombudsman Institution. License No. 106 Jin-

Guan-Tou-Xin-Xin-008 "Independently operated by Manulife Asset 
Management (Taiwan) Co., Ltd." /6F., No.89, Songren Rd., Taipei, 
Taiwan 11073, Tel: (02)2757-5999, Customer Service: 0800-070-998.) 
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